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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 15, 2016
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

  
Group 1 Pipe Restraining System for PVC Bell & Spigot Joints
  UNIT        

5 ea.    (SAWS #15266)     PRICE 19.10 19.15 19.63 19.83 21.10 21.09 21.74
1. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 4" used for PVC TOTAL 95.50 95.75 98.15 99.15 105.50 105.45 108.70

 UNIT

70 ea.   (SAWS #15262) PRICE 24.49 25.65 26.19 26.46 28.16 28.15 29.01
2. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for PVC TOTAL 1,714.30 1,795.50 1,833.30 1,852.20 1,971.20 1,970.50 2,030.70

 UNIT

100 ea.   (SAWS #15263) PRICE 41.36 41.62 42.50 42.94 45.22 45.66 47.06
3. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8" used for PVC TOTAL 4,136.00 4,162.00 4,250.00 4,294.00 4,522.00 4,566.00 4,706.00
  UNIT

 5 ea. (SAWS #15260) PRICE 71.88 72.03 73.85 74.61 83.83 79.33 81.79
4. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 10" used for PVC TOTAL 359.40 360.15 369.25 373.05 419.15 396.65 408.95

 UNIT

75 ea.   (SAWS #15242) PRICE 78.67 79.17 80.83 81.67 85.14 86.84 89.53
5. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for PVC TOTAL 5,900.25 5,937.75 6,062.25 6,125.25 6,385.50 6,513.00 6,714.75

 UNIT

15 ea.    (SAWS #15261)     PRICE 191.02 192.23 196.24 198.31 206.74 210.84 217.37
6. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 16" used for PVC TOTAL 2,865.30 2,883.45 2,943.60 2,974.65 3,101.10 3,162.60 3,260.55

UNIT

5 ea. (SAWS #32427) PRICE 324.01 324.74 332.86 336.36 346.67 357.62 368.69
7. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 20" used for PVC TOTAL 1,620.05 1,623.70 1,664.30 1,681.80 1,733.35 1,788.10 1,843.45

UNIT

25 ea. (SAWS #15244) PRICE 379.05 381.45 389.40 393.49 404.00 418.37 431.33
8. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 24" used for PVC TOTAL 9,476.25 9,536.25 9,735.00 9,837.25 10,100.00 10,459.25 10,783.25

 *       
 GROUP 1 TOTAL TOTAL 26,167.05 26,394.55 26,955.85 27,237.35 28,337.80 28,961.55 29,856.35

 Star 1100C      
Mfr Brand Star Ford 1390 Sigma Corp   Sigma Star 1100C

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. 1100C Sigma PWP,SIP/PTPVC Star Pipe Products Star 1100C  Ford PVC/DIP Rest
  
Group 2 Pipe Restraining System for Ductile Iron Bell & Spigot Joints TOTAL

  UNIT

5 ea.(SAWS #30161) PRICE NO BID 19.15 19.63 19.83 21.10 23.77 21.74
1. Restratint, Type Joint, Size 4" used for DI TOTAL  95.75 98.15 99.15 105.50 118.85 108.70

UNIT

25 ea. (SAWS #30162) PRICE NO BID 25.65 26.19 26.46 28.17 34.14 29.01
2. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for DI TOTAL  641.25 654.75 661.50 704.25 853.50 725.25

UNIT

25 ea. (SAWS #30163) PRICE NO BID 41.62 42.49 42.94 45.70 45.83 47.06
3. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8" used for DI TOTAL  1,040.50 1,062.25 1,073.50 1,142.50 1,145.75 1,176.50

UNIT

5 ea. (SAWS #30164) PRICE NO BID 72.03 73.85 74.61 78.59 80.32 81.79
4. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 10" used for DI TOTAL  360.15 369.25 373.05 392.95 401.60 408.95
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 15, 2016
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY C
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UNIT

25 ea. (SAWS #30165) PRICE NO BID 79.17 80.83 81.67 85.02 100.50 89.53
5. Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for DI TOTAL  1,979.25 2,020.75 2,041.75 2,125.50 2,512.50 2,238.25

UNIT

 5 ea. (SAWS #30166) PRICE NO BID 191.45 196.24 198.31 206.74 225.31 217.37
6. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 16" used for DI TOTAL  957.25 981.20 991.55 1,033.70 1,126.55 1,086.85

UNIT

5 ea. (SAWS #32428) PRICE NO BID 574.35 359.60 336.36 346.67 352.26 368.69
7. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 20" used for DI TOTAL  2,871.75 1,798.00 1,681.80 1,733.35 1,761.30 1,843.45

UNIT

5 ea. (SAWS #30168) PRICE NO BID 724.43 465.75 393.49 404.00 456.25 431.33
8. Restraint, Type Joint, Size 24" used for DI TOTAL  3,622.15 2,328.75 1,967.45 2,020.00 2,281.25 2,156.65

    *    
 GROUP 2 TOTAL TOTAL NO BID 11,568.05 9,313.10 8,889.75 9,257.75 10,201.30 9,744.60

 Star 1100C      
Mfr Brand  Ford 1490 Sigma Corp   Ford Star 1100C

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No.  Sigma PWP,SIP/PTPVC Star Pipe Products Star 1100C  Sigma PVC/DIP Rest
 
GROUP 3 Mechanical Joint Wedge Action Restraint for PVC Pipe

UNIT        
20 ea. (SAWS #15265) PRICE 13.92 13.55 21.13 15.26 16.05 22.70 20.73

1. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 4" used for PVC TOTAL 278.40 271.00 422.60 305.20 321.00 454.00 414.60
UNIT

500 ea.  (SAWS #15255) PRICE 16.91 16.53 26.45 17.56 19.49 28.41 25.95
2. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 6" used for PVC TOTAL 8,455.00 8,265.00 13,225.00 8,780.00 9,745.00 14,205.00 12,975.00

UNIT

250 ea.  (SAWS #15257) PRICE 25.01 24.44 35.68 25.97 27.53 38.33 35.00
3. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 8" used for PVC TOTAL 6,252.50 6,110.00 8,920.00 6,492.50 6,882.50 9,582.50 8,750.00

UNIT

 10 ea.  (SAWS #15246) PRICE 47.27 46.00 62.12 49.07 52.23 66.74 60.94
4. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 10" used for PVC TOTAL 472.70 460.00 621.20 490.70 522.30 667.40 609.40

UNIT        
150 ea. (SAWS #15248) PRICE 49.77 48.63 65.19 51.67 53.86 70.04 63.96

5. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 12" used for PVC TOTAL 7,465.50 7,294.50 9,778.50 7,750.50 8,079.00 10,506.00 9,594.00
UNIT

50 ea.  (SAWS #15250) PRICE 106.35 103.92 129.39 110.41 115.10 139.01 126.94
6. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 16" used for PVC TOTAL 5,317.50 5,196.00 6,469.50 5,520.50 5,755.00 6,950.50 6,347.00

UNIT

10 ea.  (SAWS #45452) PRICE 163.58 159.18 192.34 169.82 174.68 206.64 188.69
7. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 20" used for PVC TOTAL 1,635.80 1,591.80 1,923.40 1,698.20 1,746.80 2,066.40 1,886.90

UNIT

20 ea.  (SAWAS 15258) PRICE 188.91 184.58 222.76 196.12 204.46 239.34 218.55
8. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 24" used for PVC TOTAL 3,778.20 3,691.60 4,455.20 3,922.40 4,089.20 4,786.80 4,371.00

  *      
 GROUP 3 TOTAL TOTAL 33,655.60 32,879.90 45,815.40 34,960.00 37,140.80 49,218.60 44,947.90

      Star PVC Sgrip
Mfr Brand Star Star 4000 Sigma Corp Star 1100C   Series 4000

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. 4000 Ford 1500 Star Pipe Products Stargrip C900   Gen 2 W/ACC

2
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 15, 2016
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GROUP 4 Mechanical Joint Wedge Action Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe

UNIT

20 ea. (SAWS #15253) PRICE 11.43 11.19 18.38 11.94 13.68 19.75 18.03
1. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 4" used for DI TOTAL 228.60 223.80 367.60 238.80 273.60 395.00 360.60

UNIT

150 ea. (SAWS #15254) PRICE 13.51 13.20 22.70 14.03 15.23 24.39 22.27
2. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 6" used for DI TOTAL 2,026.50 1,980.00 3,405.00 2,104.50 2,284.50 3,658.50 3,340.50

UNIT

80 ea. (SAWS #15256) PRICE 20.32 19.85 30.93 21.09 23.92 33.24 30.35
3. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 8" used for DI TOTAL 1,625.60 1,588.00 2,474.40 1,687.20 1,913.60 2,659.20 2,428.00

UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #30172) PRICE 30.11 29.30 44.00 31.25 33.27 47.26 43.16
4. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 10" used for DI TOTAL 150.55 146.50 220.00 156.25 166.35 236.30 215.80

UNIT

40 ea.  (SAWS #15247) PRICE 43.87 42.87 59.12 45.55 48.47 63.52 58.00
5. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 12" used for DI TOTAL 1,754.80 1,714.80 2,364.80 1,822.00 1,938.80 2,540.80 2,320.00

UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #15249) PRICE 80.05 78.21 102.20 83.11 88.46 109.80 100.76
6. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 16" used for DI TOTAL 400.25 391.05 511.00 415.55 442.30 549.00 503.80

UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #15251) PRICE 140.84 137.04 168.64 146.21 154.63 181.18 165.44
7. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 20" used for DI TOTAL 704.20 685.20 843.20 731.05 773.15 905.90 827.20

UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #15252) PRICE 195.56 191.06 228.50 203.01 209.60 245.50 224.18
8. Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 24" used for DI TOTAL 977.80 955.30 1,142.50 1,015.05 1,048.00 1,227.50 1,120.90

 *      
GROUP 4 TOTAL TOTAL 7,868.30 7,684.65 11,328.50 8,170.40 8,840.30 12,172.20 11,116.80

      Star Sgrip
Mfr Brand Star Star 3000 Sigma Corp Star   Series 3000

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. 3000 Ford 1400 Star Pipe Products Stargrip DI   W/ACC
 Compression Ring Pipe Restraining System for PVC Pipe to 
GROUP 5 Mechanical Joint Fittings

UNIT

20 ea.  (SAWS #30174) PRICE NO BID 17.05 26.45 36.68 NO BID 53.66 19.35
1. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6" used for PVC TOTAL  341.00 529.00 733.60 1,073.20 387.00

UNIT

20 ea.  (SAWS #30175) PRICE NO BID 25.21 35.68 52.28 NO BID 75.27 32.24
2. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8" used for PVC TOTAL  504.20 713.60 1,045.60 1,505.40 644.80

UNIT

15 ea.  (SAWS #15259) PRICE NO BID 50.17 65.19 102.33 NO BID 138.63 57.94
3. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12" used for PVC TOTAL  752.55 977.85 1,534.95 2,079.45 869.10

*
GROUP 5 TOTAL TOTAL NO BID 1,597.75 2,220.45 3,314.15 NO BID 4,658.05 1,900.90

      
Mfr Brand Star-PVG-00  Romac Romac  

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. Romac Grap IP Star Pipe Products Gripring for C900 Grap-IP  

3
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 Compression Ring Pipe Restraining System for Ductile Iron Pipe to
GROUP 6 Mechanical Joint Fittings

UNIT

100 ea.  (SAWS #30176) PRICE NO BID 35.91 NO BID 36.68 NO BID 44.95 19.35
1. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6" used for DI TOTAL  3,591.00  3,668.00 4,495.00 1,935.00

UNIT

20 ea.   (SAWS #30177) PRICE NO BID 51.18 NO BID 52.28 NO BID 64.08 32.24
2. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8" used for DI TOTAL  1,023.60  1,045.60 1,281.60 644.80

UNIT

15 ea.  (SAWS #30178) PRICE NO BID 100.18 NO BID 102.33 NO BID 125.42 57.94
3. Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12" used for DI TOTAL  1,502.70  1,534.95 1,881.30 869.10

*
GROUP 6 TOTAL TOTAL NO BID 6,117.30 NO BID 6,248.55 NO BID 7,657.90 3,448.90

    
Mfr Brand  Romac   Romac Romac Star 1000

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No.  Grap DI  Gripring for DI Grap-DI PVC/DIP Rest
 
GROUP 7 Accessory Sets

150 ea.  (SAWS #9062) UNIT

Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 4", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 8.68 7.95 8.63 9.00 9.27 8.45 11.38
1. and Gaskets TOTAL 1,302.00 1,192.50 1,294.50 1,350.00 1,390.50 1,267.50 1,707.00

1,500 ea.  (SAWS #9063) UNIT

Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 6", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 12.07 11.10 12.00 12.52 12.28 11.76 15.83
2. and Gaskets TOTAL 18,105.00 16,650.00 18,000.00 18,780.00 18,420.00 17,640.00 23,745.00

400 ea.  (SAWS #9064) UNIT

Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 8", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 13.65 12.49 13.50 14.09 13.28 13.22 17.81
3. and Gaskets TOTAL 5,460.00 4,996.00 5,400.00 5,636.00 5,312.00 5,288.00 7,124.00

50 ea.  (SAWS #9058) UNIT

Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 10", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 19.25 17.62 19.13 19.96 18.78 18.74 25.23
4. and Gaskets TOTAL 962.50 881.00 956.50 998.00 939.00 937.00 1,261.50

150 ea.  (SAWS #9059) UNIT

Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 12", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 20.40 18.66 20.25 21.13 20.54 19.84 26.72
5. and Gaskets TOTAL 3,060.00 2,799.00 3,037.50 3,169.50 3,081.00 2,976.00 4,008.00

150 ea.  (SAWS #9060) UNIT

Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 16", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 33.25 30.53 33.00 34.43 32.42 32.33 43.54
6. and Gaskets TOTAL 4,987.50 4,579.50 4,950.00 5,164.50 4,863.00 4,849.50 6,531.00

5 ea.  (SAWS #15891) UNIT

Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 20", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 62.35 57.01 61.88 64.57 60.78 60.61 81.63
7. and Gaskets TOTAL 311.75 285.05 309.40 322.85 303.90 303.05 408.15

30 ea.  (SAWS #9061) UNIT

Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 24", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands PRICE 87.30 79.82 86.63 90.39 83.35 84.86 114.28
8. and Gaskets TOTAL 2,619.00 2,394.60 2,598.90 2,711.70 2,500.50 2,545.80 3,428.40

  *      
GROUP 7 TOTAL TOTAL 36,807.75 33,777.65 36,546.80 38,132.55 36,809.90 35,806.85 48,213.05

       
Mfr Brand Star Star Sigma Corp Star  Ford Star  

Manufacturer Brand and Part Number Part No. MJGP MJGP Star Pipe Products MJGP  Sigma MJ GP
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  
FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints

TIME & (June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 15, 2016
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EXTENSION 1 26,167.05 75,939.95 8,889.75 3,448.90

EXTENSION 2 26,167.05 75,939.95 8,889.75 3,448.90

EXTENSION 3 26,167.05 75,939.95 8,889.75 3,448.90
Net Net Net Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days 10 days 7-10 days 21 days 2-3 weeks 3 days
 
 
*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
 
Act Pipe and Supply Demandstar
AY McDonald SAWS Website
Cohen Industrial Supply
Corix Water Products

Ferguson Waterworks

Fortiline

HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd.

KLP Commercial

Morrison Supply Co.

MS Techline Pipe
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